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Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>

Manuscript Submission (Sri Setyo Iriani)
19 pesan

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 8 Oktober 2019 pukul 20.59
Kepada: submission@rjoas.com

Dear Sergey Plygun
Editor-in-Chief of Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences,

Through this e-mail, We/I would like to send you our manuscript to your journal to be reviewed and published. The
title is 'Traditional Market Management Strategy on Fcing Modern Market Development'.
Please kindly check. 
We will be waiting for your feedback.

Thank you.

Best regards,
Sri Setyo Iriani

2 lampiran

SRI SETYO IRIANI - SUBMISSION.docx
162K

SRI SETYO IRIANI - SUBMISSION.pdf
281K

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 9 Oktober 2019 pukul 06.00
Kepada: Sanaji Sanaji <sanaji@unesa.ac.id>

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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SRI SETYO IRIANI - SUBMISSION.pdf
281K

Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> 10 Oktober 2019 pukul 17.35
Kepada: "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>

Hello,
 
file received and will be reviewed within 10 working days.
 
-- 
Sergey Plygun
 
 
08.10.2019, 16:59, "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>:
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>
Date: Tue, Oct 8, 2019 at 8:59 PM
Subject: Manuscript Submission (Sri Setyo Iriani)
To: <submission@rjoas.com>

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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162K
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281K

Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> 19 Oktober 2019 pukul 22.48
Kepada: "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>

Hello,
 
by the decision of Editorial Board your paper recommended for publishing in issue 10(94) of October 2019.
In order to continue with publishing process, please complete fee transfer: detailed information available at
https://rjoas.com/publication-fee/
Provisional acceptance of paper expires on October 22, 2019.
 
If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact us!
 
Regards,
Sergey Plygun
 
 
 
08.10.2019, 16:59, "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>:
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 21 Oktober 2019 pukul 20.57
Kepada: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>

Dear Sergey Plygun
Editor-in-Chief of Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences,

I am sorry for the late reply. We will process the payment and inform it to you as soon as possible.
Thank you very much for the information.

Best regards,
Sri Setyo Iriani
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 22 Oktober 2019 pukul 04.48
Kepada: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>

Dear Editor,

Could you inform me the detail number for my paper and also help me by sending the LoA, please?
Thank you very much for your help. The payment for the paper is on process.

Once again, thank you.

Best regards,
Sri Setyo Iriani

On Sat, Oct 19, 2019 at 10:48 PM Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> wrote:
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 22 Oktober 2019 pukul 09.10
Kepada: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>

Dear Editor,

I have completed the payment for my paper via PayPal. I attach the payment receipt in this email.
Please kindly check it.

Regards,
Sri Setyo Iriani

On Sat, Oct 19, 2019 at 10:48 PM Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> wrote:
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

PayPal_ Payment for Sri Setyo Iriani's Paper.pdf
94K

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 25 Oktober 2019 pukul 17.07
Kepada: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>

Dear Sergey Plygun,
Editor-in-Chief of Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences 

I have completed the payment for my paper in October 22th, 2019.
Have you received it? Because I don't see my paper in the Table of Contents of the October issue.
Thank you. I will be waiting for your reply.

Best regards,
Sri Setyo Iriani

On Sat, Oct 19, 2019 at 10:48 PM Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> wrote:
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> 25 Oktober 2019 pukul 17.22
Kepada: "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>

Hello,
 
could you please inform us on how the transfer was completed - bank, PayPal, and who have completed it (we ll need
PayPal account or bank details)?
 
-- 
Sergey Plygun
 
 
 
25.10.2019, 13:07, "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>:
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 26 Oktober 2019 pukul 07.28
Kepada: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>

Dear Editor,  

Here are the payment details. It was completed via PayPal.
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

PayPal_ Payment for Sri Setyo Iriani's Paper.pdf
94K

Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> 26 Oktober 2019 pukul 15.27
Kepada: "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>
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Hello,
 
as it can be seen from our records transfer wasnt completed using your email account; from what account transfer
was completed?
 
-- 
Sergey Plygun
 
 
 
26.10.2019, 03:29, "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>:
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 26 Oktober 2019 pukul 17.25
Kepada: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>
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ID Transaksi: 6SR31619FD892313X 22 Oktober 2019

  Jumlah Pembayaran yang dikirim    
$130,00 USD

Biaya                              
             

Dear Editor,

Yes, the transfer was completed using this email account: puritysabila@gmail.com (Purity Ajiningrum). I send you the
detail in this email.

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: service@intl.paypal.com <service@intl.paypal.com>
Date: Tue, 22 Oct 2019 at 07.15
Subject: Anda telah mengirim pembayaran
To: Purity Ajiningrum <puritysabila@gmail.com>

 
Yth. Purity Ajiningrum,

   

 

       

Anda telah mengirim
$130,00 USD kepada Плыгун

Сергей Анатольевич.

Rincian Transaksi

mailto:puritysabila@gmail.com
mailto:service@intl.paypal.com
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$9,71 USD

DIBAYAR DENGAN

VISA 6645 $139,71 USD

Anda telah membayar $139,71 USD

 

Bantuan & Hubungi  |  Keamanan  |  Aplikasi

 

   

  Jangan membalas email ini. Untuk menghubungi kami, klik Bantuan dan Hubungi.  

 

Hak Cipta © 1999-2019 PayPal. Hak cipta dilindungi oleh undang-undang.

Nasihat untuk konsumen - Sebagai pemegang fasilitas nilai tersimpan PayPal, PayPal Pte.
Ltd. tidak memerlukan persetujuan dari Monetary Authority of Singapore. Pengguna
disarankan untuk membaca syarat dan ketentuan dengan cermat.

PayPal PPC000956:1.4.5:5825f6f8f1156

 

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 28 Oktober 2019 pukul 18.58
Kepada: Anna Anfit <annaanfit69@gmail.com>
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Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 28 Oktober 2019 pukul 18.59
Kepada: Anna Anfit <annaanfit69@gmail.com>

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 28 Oktober 2019 pukul 19.02
Kepada: Anna Anfit <annaanfit69@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>
Date: Tue, Oct 22, 2019 at 9:10 AM
Subject: Re: Manuscript Submission (Sri Setyo Iriani)
To: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

PayPal_ Payment for Sri Setyo Iriani's Paper.pdf
94K

Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 28 Oktober 2019 pukul 20.23
Kepada: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>

Dear Editor,

How about my paper? Have you checked our payment?
Thank you. I will be waiting for your reply.

Best regards,
Sri Setyo Iriani
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> 30 Oktober 2019 pukul 14.24
Kepada: "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>

Hello,
 
transfer has been verified, loa for paper attached to the letter.
 
-- 
Sergey Plygun
 
 
 
28.10.2019, 16:23, "Sri Setyo Iriani ." <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id>:
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

letter_2019-390_Iriani.pdf
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Sri Setyo Iriani . <srisetyo@unesa.ac.id> 30 Oktober 2019 pukul 17.08
Kepada: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>

Dear Editor,
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Thank you for the information.
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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